
 
 
 

 
Commonwealth of Virginia 

Virginia Information Technologies Agency 
 

MISCELLANEOUS COMPUTER PRODUCTS AND ACCESSORIES 
 

Optional Use Contract 
 

Date:                August 5, 2010 
 
Contract #:               VA-040227-DALY  
  
Authorized User:              All public bodies, including VITA, as defined by 
                                        §2.2-4301 and referenced by §2.2-4304 of the 
                Code of Virginia 
 
Contractor:               DALY Computers, Inc. 
                22521 Gateway Center Drive 
                Clarksburg, MD  20871  
      
FIN: 52-1541086  
 
Contact Person:               800-955-DALY Option 2  
                                 VAsales@daly.com     
 
Term:                August 1, 2010 – September 30, 2010  
 
Payment:               Net 30 days 
 
 
For Additional Information, Please Contact: 
 
Virginia Information Technologies Agency 
Supply Chain Management  
 
Greg Scearce  
Phone:  804-416-6166 
Fax:      804-416-6361 
Email:  gregory.scearce@vita.virginia.gov  
 
 
NOTES:    For updates, please visit our Website at:  http://www.vita.virginia.gov/procurement/procurement.cfm   
 
 
Prior review and approval by the VIRGINIA INFORMATION TECHNOLOGIES AGENCY (VITA) for 
purchases in excess of $100,000.00 is required for State Agencies and Institutions only. 
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CONTRACT #VA-040227-DALY 
CONTRACT CHANGE LOG 

Change               Effective 
No.                  Description of Change             Date 

1 Mod 1 incorporates “Commonwealth Employee Purchases” 4/15/04 

2 Mod 2 adds “Non-Appropriation” Clause to contract terms 4/23/04 

3 Mod 3 adds discount for Watchguard products to contract 5/17/04 

4 Mod 4 adds CRU “Optical & Storage” devices w/8% discount 6/15/04 

5 Mod 5 adds pricing for Foundry Networking & Wireless products 7/13/04 

6 Mod 6 adds Sharp projectors and monitors at 15% discount 7/20/04 

7  Mod 7 updates Attachment B “Pricing” 8/10/04 

8 Mod 8 adds discounts to pricing on Attachment B for Asante Networking 
Devices & Quantum Optical devices  

9/8/04 

9 Mod 9 adds discount pricing on Attachment B for Iron Port Networking 
Devices 

9/27/04 

10 Mod 10 adds discount pricing on Attachment B for Crucial Technology 
Memory at 5% 

11/1/04 

11 Mod 11 deletes Iron Port Networking Devices from the contract 6/24/05 

12 Mod 12 adds Symbol Tech Scanners & LG Electronics Monitors to 
Attachment B “Pricing” at discount pricing 

8/19/05 

13 Mod 13 adds Source Technology Printers to Attachment B 9/30/05 

14 Mod 14 adds ELO TouchSystems Monitors to the contract 12/21/05 

15 Mod 15 extends contract term 3/2/06 

16 Mod 16 documents “Percent Off “ Index Pricing 2/16/06 

17 Mod 17 adds IQinvision cameras at 5% discount to contract 5/30/06 

18 Mod 18 extends contract terms 3/2/07 

19 Mod 19 extends contract terms 3/2/08 

20 Mod 20 adds Case Logic  cameras at 25% discount to contract 5/30/08 

21 Mod 21 extends contract term for 5 months for the marketing and selling 
of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure anything 
else from this contract 

3/1/09 

22 Mod 22 extends contract term for 3 months for the marketing and selling 
of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure anything 
else from this contract 

8/1/09 

23 Mod 23 extends contract for an additional 3 months for marketing and 
selling of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure 
anything else form this contract 

11/1/09 

24 Mod 24 extends contract for an additional 3 months for marketing and 
selling of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure 
anything else form this contract 

2/1/10 

25 Mod 25 extends contract for an additional 3 months for marketing and 
selling of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure 
anything else form this contract 

5/1/10 

26 Mod 26 extends contract for an additional 2 months for marketing and 
selling of printers ONLY – COV Authorized Users not allowed to procure 
anything else form this contract 

8/1/10 

   

   





































































































ATTACHMENT B
VA-040227-Daly PRICING

PRINTERS Higher Ed. Discount State & Local Disc. Price Reference
Manufacturer:

HP/Compaq 31.00% 31.00% www.hp.com

DELL 4% 4% www.dell.com

IBM 14.00% 14.00% www.ibm.com

XEROX 29.00% 29.00% www.xerox.com

LEXMARK 26.50% 26.50% www.lexmark.com

EPSON 14.00% 14.00% www.epson.com

Brother 48.00% 48.00% www.brother.com

CANON 16.00% 16.00% www.canon.com

OKIDATA 35.00% 35.00% www.okidata.com

MEMORY
Mfg:

  Power User   No Bid No Bid 
Kingston   30.00% 30.00% www.kingston.com

 HP/Compaq   12% 12% www.hp.com

 Lexar Media   No Bid No Bid 
 Kingston - Value Ram   14.00% 14.00% www.valueram.com

SanDisk Corporation 35% 35% www.sandisk.com

 IBM   10.00% 10.00% www.ibm.com

Dell 4% 4% www.dell.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid 
Simpletech 47.00% 47.00% www.simpletech.com

MONITORS
Mfg:

NEC/Mitsubishi 11.00% 11.00% www.nec.com

Planar 5% 5% www.planar.com

Phillips 30.00% 30.00% www.philips.com

Sony 13.00% 13.00% www.sony.com

ViewSonic 23.00% 23.00% www.viewsonic.com

Acer 6% 6% www.acer.com

ProView 13.00% 13.00% www.proview.com

Enivision Peripherals(EPI) No Bid No Bid www.aocmonitor.com/epius

CTX 39.00% 39.00% www.ctxintl.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid 
DELL 5% 5% www.dell.com

IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

HP 14.00% 14.00% www.hp.com

EIZO 18.00% 18.00% www.eizo.com

BENQ 21.50% 21.50% www.benq.com

AOC 30% 30% www.aocmonitor.com

Samsung 27.00% 27.00% www.samsung.com



PROJECTORS

Mfg:
Canon 35% (See Note 25) 35% (See Note 25) www.canon.com

Epson 44.00% 44.00% www.epson.com

InFocus 41.00% 41.00% www.infocus.com

DELL 5% (See Note 26) 5% (See Note 26)
Mistubishi 40% (See Note 27) 40% (See Note 27) www.mitsubishi.com

NEC 40% (See Note 28) 40% (See Note 28) www.nec.com

Proxima 40.00% 40.00% www.proima.com

Sony 27% (See Note 29) 27% (See Note 29) www.sony.com

Toshiba 40.00% 40.00% www.toshiba.com

ViewSonic 23.00% 23.00% www.viewsonic.com

OPTOMA 54.00% 54.00% www.optoma.com

POWER SUPPLIES
Mfg:

APC 20.00% 20.00% www.apc.com

Belkin 34.00% 34.00% www.belkin.com

Tripp-Lite 34.00% 34.00% www.tripplite.com

Fellowes 57.00% 57.00% www.fellowes.com

NETWORK ACCESS.
Mfg:

3 Com 33.00% 33.00% www.3com.com

Linksys 47.00% 47.00% www.linksys.com

IBM 12.00% 12.00% www.ibm.com

Intel 33.00% 33.00% www.intel.com

Hawking Technology 57.00% 57.00% www.hawkingtech.com

NetGear 36.00% 36.00% www.netgear.com

D-Link 41.00% 41.00% www.dlink.com

Belkin 53.00% 53.00% www.belkin.com

PowerDsine No Bid No Bid
Allied Telesyn 23.00% 23.00% www.alliedtelesyn.com

OPTICAL & STORAGE
Mfg:

Iomega 17.00% 17.00% www.iomega.com

Sony 18.00% 18.00% www.sony.com

Plextor 20.00% 20.00% www.plextor.com

Samsung 20% 20% www.samsung.com

Memorex 26.00% 26.00% www.memorex.com

La Cie 11.00% 11.00% www.lacie.com

HP/Compaq 16.00% 16.00% www.hp.com

DELL 5% 5%
IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid
Maxtor 46.00% 46.00% www.maxtor.com

Seagate 28.00% 28.00% www.seagate.com



INPUT DEVICES
Mfg:

Logitech 28.00% 28.00% www.logitech.com

Microsoft 33.00% 33.00% www.microsoft.com

Fellowes 54.00% 54.00% www.fellowes.com

Kensington 44.00% 44.00% www.kensington.com

Labtec 43.00% 43.00% www.labtec.com

Adaptec 21.00% 21.00% www.adaptec.com

Simple Technology 45.00% 45.00% www.simpletech.com

IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

DELL 5% 5%
Gateway No Bid No Bid

HP 11.00% 11.00% www.hp.com

Memorex 45.00% 45.00% www.memorex.com

PDAs
Mfg:

Palm 15.00% 15.00% www.palm.com

HP/Compaq 6.00% 6.00% www.hp.com

Sony 14.00% 14.00% www.sony.com

Dell 5% 5%
Sharp 18.00% 18.00% www.sharpusa.com

Toshiba 22.00% 22.00% www.toshiba.com

Handspring 12.00% 12.00% www.handspring.com

ViewSonic 8.00% 8.00% www.viewsonic.com

SCANNERS
Mfg:

Epson 17.00% 17.00% www.epson.com

Fujitsu 33.00% 33.00% www.fujitsu.com

HP/Compaq 27.00% 27.00% www.hp.com

Kodak 3% 3% www.kodak.com

Canon 35.00% 35.00% www.canon.com

Microtek 16.00% 16.00% www.microtek.com

PROCESSOR UPGRADES
Mfg:

Intel 15.00% 15.00% www.intel.com

AMD 5.00% 5.00% www.amd.com

CABLES
Mfg:

APC 56.00% 56.00% www.apc.com

Tripp-Lite 67.00% 67.00% www.tripplite.com

3M 41% 41% www.3m.com

Star-Tech 54.00% 54.00% www.startech.com

Belkin 58.00% 58.00% www.belkin.com

Iogear 31.00% 31.00% www.iogear.com

HP/Compaq 10.00% 10.00% www.hp.com

Belden 5% 5%
BlackBox 20.00% 20.00% www.blackbox.com



EXPANSION CARDS
Mfg:

ATI 18.00% 18.00% www.ati.com

3COM 30.00% 30.00% www.3com.com

NetGear 37.00% 37.00% www.netgear.com

Creative Labs 19.00% 19.00% www.creativelabs.com

Allied Telesyn 22.00% 22.00% www.alliedtelesyn.com

HP/Compaq 17% 17% www.hp.com

Linksys 21.00% 21.00% www.linksys.com

Orinoco No Bid No Bid
Jaton 26.00% 26.00% www.jaton.com

PNY 27.00% 27.00% www.pny.com

CAMERAS
Mfg:

Kodak 15.00% 15.00% www.kodak.com

Sharp No Bid No Bid 
Panasanic 2% 2%

Sony 20.00% 20.00% www.sony.com

Canon 21.00% 21.00% www.canon.com

Nikon 20.00% 20.00% www.nikon.com

Olympus 38.00% 38.00% www.olympusamerica.com

Minolta  22.50% 22.50% www.minolta.com

JVC 2% 2%
HP/Compaq  26.00% 26.00% www.hp.com

Sharp No Bid No Bid
Fuji 21.50% 21.50% www.fujifilm.com

OTHER
Mfg:

Targus 29.50% 29.50% www.targus.com

Fellowes 51.00% 51.00% www.fellowes.com

APC 30.00% 30.00% www.apc.com

Kensington 44.00% 44.00% www.kensington.com

Belkins 49.00% 49.00% www.bekin.com

3M 38.00% 38.00% www.3m.com

Cables to Go 40.00% 40.00% www.cablestogo.com

IBM 11% 11% www.ibm.com

HP/Compaq 8% 8% www.hp.com

DELL 5% 5%
Gateway No Bid No Bid













































ATTACHMENT B
VA-040227-Daly PRICING

PRINTERS Higher Ed. Discount State & Local Disc. Price Reference
Manufacturer:

HP/Compaq 31.00% 31.00% www.hp.com

DELL 4% 4% www.dell.com

IBM 14.00% 14.00% www.ibm.com

XEROX 29.00% 29.00% www.xerox.com

LEXMARK 26.50% 26.50% www.lexmark.com

EPSON 14.00% 14.00% www.epson.com

Brother 48.00% 48.00% www.brother.com

CANON 16.00% 16.00% www.canon.com

OKIDATA 35.00% 35.00% www.okidata.com

MEMORY
Mfg:

  Power User   No Bid No Bid 
Kingston   30.00% 30.00% www.kingston.com

 HP/Compaq   12% 12% www.hp.com

 Lexar Media   No Bid No Bid 
 Kingston - Value Ram   14.00% 14.00% www.valueram.com

SanDisk Corporation 35% 35% www.sandisk.com

 IBM   10.00% 10.00% www.ibm.com

Dell 4% 4% www.dell.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid 
Simpletech 47.00% 47.00% www.simpletech.com

MONITORS
Mfg:

NEC/Mitsubishi 11.00% 11.00% www.nec.com

Planar 5% 5% www.planar.com

Phillips 30.00% 30.00% www.philips.com

Sony 13.00% 13.00% www.sony.com

ViewSonic 23.00% 23.00% www.viewsonic.com

Acer 6% 6% www.acer.com

ProView 13.00% 13.00% www.proview.com

Enivision Peripherals(EPI) No Bid No Bid www.aocmonitor.com/epius

CTX 39.00% 39.00% www.ctxintl.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid 
DELL 5% 5% www.dell.com

IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

HP 14.00% 14.00% www.hp.com

EIZO 18.00% 18.00% www.eizo.com

BENQ 21.50% 21.50% www.benq.com

AOC 30% 30% www.aocmonitor.com

Samsung 27.00% 27.00% www.samsung.com



PROJECTORS

Mfg:
Canon 35% (See Note 25) 35% (See Note 25) www.canon.com

Epson 44.00% 44.00% www.epson.com

InFocus 41.00% 41.00% www.infocus.com

DELL 5% (See Note 26) 5% (See Note 26)
Mistubishi 40% (See Note 27) 40% (See Note 27) www.mitsubishi.com

NEC 40% (See Note 28) 40% (See Note 28) www.nec.com

Proxima 40.00% 40.00% www.proima.com

Sony 27% (See Note 29) 27% (See Note 29) www.sony.com

Toshiba 40.00% 40.00% www.toshiba.com

ViewSonic 23.00% 23.00% www.viewsonic.com

OPTOMA 54.00% 54.00% www.optoma.com

POWER SUPPLIES
Mfg:

APC 20.00% 20.00% www.apc.com

Belkin 34.00% 34.00% www.belkin.com

Tripp-Lite 34.00% 34.00% www.tripplite.com

Fellowes 57.00% 57.00% www.fellowes.com

NETWORK ACCESS.
Mfg:

3 Com 33.00% 33.00% www.3com.com

Linksys 47.00% 47.00% www.linksys.com

IBM 12.00% 12.00% www.ibm.com

Intel 33.00% 33.00% www.intel.com

Hawking Technology 57.00% 57.00% www.hawkingtech.com

NetGear 36.00% 36.00% www.netgear.com

D-Link 41.00% 41.00% www.dlink.com

Belkin 53.00% 53.00% www.belkin.com

PowerDsine No Bid No Bid
Allied Telesyn 23.00% 23.00% www.alliedtelesyn.com

OPTICAL & STORAGE
Mfg:

Iomega 17.00% 17.00% www.iomega.com

Sony 18.00% 18.00% www.sony.com

Plextor 20.00% 20.00% www.plextor.com

Samsung 20% 20% www.samsung.com

Memorex 26.00% 26.00% www.memorex.com

La Cie 11.00% 11.00% www.lacie.com

HP/Compaq 16.00% 16.00% www.hp.com

DELL 5% 5%
IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

Gateway No Bid No Bid
Maxtor 46.00% 46.00% www.maxtor.com

Seagate 28.00% 28.00% www.seagate.com



INPUT DEVICES
Mfg:

Logitech 28.00% 28.00% www.logitech.com

Microsoft 33.00% 33.00% www.microsoft.com

Fellowes 54.00% 54.00% www.fellowes.com

Kensington 44.00% 44.00% www.kensington.com

Labtec 43.00% 43.00% www.labtec.com

Adaptec 21.00% 21.00% www.adaptec.com

Simple Technology 45.00% 45.00% www.simpletech.com

IBM 11.00% 11.00% www.ibm.com

DELL 5% 5%
Gateway No Bid No Bid

HP 11.00% 11.00% www.hp.com

Memorex 45.00% 45.00% www.memorex.com

PDAs
Mfg:

Palm 15.00% 15.00% www.palm.com

HP/Compaq 6.00% 6.00% www.hp.com

Sony 14.00% 14.00% www.sony.com

Dell 5% 5%
Sharp 18.00% 18.00% www.sharpusa.com

Toshiba 22.00% 22.00% www.toshiba.com

Handspring 12.00% 12.00% www.handspring.com

ViewSonic 8.00% 8.00% www.viewsonic.com

SCANNERS
Mfg:

Epson 17.00% 17.00% www.epson.com

Fujitsu 33.00% 33.00% www.fujitsu.com

HP/Compaq 27.00% 27.00% www.hp.com

Kodak 3% 3% www.kodak.com

Canon 35.00% 35.00% www.canon.com

Microtek 16.00% 16.00% www.microtek.com

PROCESSOR UPGRADES
Mfg:

Intel 15.00% 15.00% www.intel.com

AMD 5.00% 5.00% www.amd.com

CABLES
Mfg:

APC 56.00% 56.00% www.apc.com

Tripp-Lite 67.00% 67.00% www.tripplite.com

3M 41% 41% www.3m.com

Star-Tech 54.00% 54.00% www.startech.com

Belkin 58.00% 58.00% www.belkin.com

Iogear 31.00% 31.00% www.iogear.com

HP/Compaq 10.00% 10.00% www.hp.com

Belden 5% 5%
BlackBox 20.00% 20.00% www.blackbox.com



EXPANSION CARDS
Mfg:

ATI 18.00% 18.00% www.ati.com

3COM 30.00% 30.00% www.3com.com

NetGear 37.00% 37.00% www.netgear.com

Creative Labs 19.00% 19.00% www.creativelabs.com

Allied Telesyn 22.00% 22.00% www.alliedtelesyn.com

HP/Compaq 17% 17% www.hp.com

Linksys 21.00% 21.00% www.linksys.com

Orinoco No Bid No Bid
Jaton 26.00% 26.00% www.jaton.com

PNY 27.00% 27.00% www.pny.com

CAMERAS
Mfg:

Kodak 15.00% 15.00% www.kodak.com

Sharp No Bid No Bid 
Panasanic 2% 2%

Sony 20.00% 20.00% www.sony.com

Canon 21.00% 21.00% www.canon.com

Nikon 20.00% 20.00% www.nikon.com

Olympus 38.00% 38.00% www.olympusamerica.com

Minolta  22.50% 22.50% www.minolta.com

JVC 2% 2%
HP/Compaq  26.00% 26.00% www.hp.com

Sharp No Bid No Bid
Fuji 21.50% 21.50% www.fujifilm.com

OTHER
Mfg:

Targus 29.50% 29.50% www.targus.com

Fellowes 51.00% 51.00% www.fellowes.com

APC 30.00% 30.00% www.apc.com

Kensington 44.00% 44.00% www.kensington.com

Belkins 49.00% 49.00% www.bekin.com

3M 38.00% 38.00% www.3m.com

Cables to Go 40.00% 40.00% www.cablestogo.com

IBM 11% 11% www.ibm.com

HP/Compaq 8% 8% www.hp.com

DELL 5% 5%
Gateway No Bid No Bid
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