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Peripherals

Minimum Configurations

A. Flash Drives Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Mfg. Description Part Number
2 GB AXIOM 2GB Flash Drive USBFD2/2GB-AX $12.99 25.00% $9.74 www.pcmallgov.com 
2 GB EDGE 2GB Flash Drive PE196530 $11.99 25.00% $8.99 www.pcmallgov.com 

2 GB KINGSTON KINGSTON DATA TRAVELER2GB Flash Drive DTI/2GB $10.00 25.00% $7.50 www.pcmallgov.com 

4 GB IMATION 4 GB Flash Drive 26309 $33.99 25.00% $25.49 www.pcmallgov.com 
4 GB AXIOM 4 GB Flash Drive USBFD2/4GB-AX $20.00 25.00% $15.00 www.pcmallgov.com 

4 GB KINGSTON KINGSTON DATA TRAVELER 4 GB Flash Drive DTI/4GB $16.99 25.00% $12.74 www.pcmallgov.com 

8 GB SANDISK 8 GB Flash Drive SDCZ7-8192-A11 $59.99 25.00% $44.99 www.pcmallgov.com 
8 GB CORSAIR 8 GB Flash Drive CMFUSB2.0-8GB $41.99 25.00% $31.49 www.pcmallgov.com 

8 GB KINGSTON KINGSTON DATA TRAVELER 8GB Flash Drive DTI/8GB $29.99 25.00% $22.49 www.pcmallgov.com 

B. Monitors (wide aspect) Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

17" LCD Lenovo ThinkVision L171p 17" LCD Monitor 9417HC2 $239.99 16.00% $201.59 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD Lenovo ThinkVision L174 17" LCD Monitor  9227AE1 $229.99 17.00% $190.89 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD HP L1750 17" LCD Monitor - Analog/Digital GF904AA#ABA $269.99 14.00% $232.19 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD HP w1707 17-inch Widescreen Flat Panel Monitor KB744AA#ABA $210.00 17.00% $174.30 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD NEC ASLCD73VX-BK 17IN LCD-12X10 700:1 5MS ASLCD73VX-BK $247.99 17.00% $205.83 www.pcmallgov.com 

17" LCD HP L1745 17" TFT Flat Panel Display - Analog/Digital GE178A8#ABA $239.99 17.00% $199.11 www.pcmallgov.com 

17" LCD HP HP w1707 17-inch Widescreen Flat Panel Monitor KB744AA#ABA $210.00 17.00% $174.30 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD Planar  PL1700 17" Monitor, Black 997-2795-00 $205.00 17.00% $170.15 www.pcmallgov.com 

17" LCD Planar PL1711M 17" Flat Panel LCD Dual-Input Monitor 997-3111-00 $239.99 14.00% $206.39 www.pcmallgov.com 

17" LCD Viewsonic
Optiquest 17" LCD with super-fast 5ms video 
response Q72B $245.00 17.00% $203.35 www.pcmallgov.com 

17" LCD Samsung 17" LCD Monitor 743BX $269.00 17.00% $223.27 www.pcmallgov.com 
17" LCD AOC 17" LCD Monitor 718SWAG-1 $175.99 17.00% $146.07 WWW.PCMALL.COM
17" LCD HP 17" LCD Monitor GV537A8#ABA $169.00 11.00% $150.41 WWW.PCMALL.COM
17" LCD ACER 17" LCD Monitor ET.BX3WP.002 $161.99 11.00% $144.17 WWW.PCMALL.COM

19" LCD HP L1950 19'' Flat Panel LCD Monitor GG458AA#ABA $319.00 14.00% $274.34 www.pcmallgov.com 

19" LCD HP W1907 19" Widescreen Flat Panel LCD Monitor RK283AA#ABA $239.99 17.00% $199.19 www.pcmallgov.com 
19" LCD Planar PL1900 19" Flat Panel LCD Monitor 997-3095-00 $239.99 14.00% $206.39 www.pcmallgov.com 

19" LCD Planar PL1911M 19'' Flat Panel LCD Dual-Input Monitor 997-3113-00 $279.99 14.00% $240.79 www.pcmallgov.com 
19" LCD Planar  PL2010M 20" Flat Panel LCD Display 997-2827-00 $399.00 17.00% $331.17 www.pcmallgov.com 
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19" LCD Viewsonic 19" Widescreen LCD Monitor VX1962WM $299.00 17.00% $248.17 www.pcmallgov.com 
19" LCD Viewsonic 20" Value Series Widescreen LCD Display VA2026W $325.00 17.00% $269.75 www.pcmallgov.com 
19" LCD Samsung 943N 19" LCD Monitor 943N $319.00 17.00% $264.77 www.pcmallgov.com 

19" LCD Samsung
SyncMaster 920NW 19" Superior Quality LCD 
Monitor 920NW $259.00 17.00% $214.97 www.pcmallgov.com 

19" LCD Samsung 2032NW 20" Wide Screen LCD Monitor 2032NW $259.99 16.00% $217.56 www.pcmallgov.com 
19" LCD AOC 19" Widescreen LCD Monitor 919SW-1 $193.99 17.00% $161.11 WWW.PCMALL.COM
19" LCD ACER 19" Widescreen LCD Monitor ET.1916B.WDA $179.99 9.00% $163.79 WWW.PCMALL.COM
19" LCD SAMSUNG 19" Widescreen LCD Monitor 920NW $259.00 17.00% $214.97 WWW.PCMALL.COM

21" LCD Lenovo ThinkVision L200p Wide 20.1" LCD Monitor  4438HB6 $289.99 14.00% $249.39 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD Lenovo ThinkVision L220x Wide 22" LCD Monitor 4433HB2 $499.00 15.00% $424.15 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD HP L2245w 22-inch Widescreen LCD Monitor GX008AA#ABA $349.00 12.00% $307.12 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD HP L2208w 22-inch Widescreen LCD Monitor GX007AA#ABA $329.00 12.00% $289.52 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD Princeton Princeton  20.1" Widescreen LCD Display - Black LCD2008W $399.99 12.00% $351.99 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD HP HP Pavilion w2207h 22" LCD Monitor GM757AA#ABA $329.99 12.00% $290.39 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD HP  LP2275w 22" Widescreen LCD Monitor KE289A4#ABA $459.99 10.00% $413.99 www.pcmallgov.com 

21" LCD Planar
PX2210MW 22" Widescreen DVI LCD Monitor 
Black with Built-In Speakers 997-3372-00 $308.99 9.00% $281.18 www.pcmallgov.com 

21" LCD Planar PL2210MW 22" Widescreen LCD Monitor 997-5265-00 $265.99 14.00% $228.75 www.pcmallgov.com 

21" LCD Viewsonic
VX2235wm 22" X Series Widescreen LCD 
Monitor VX2235WM $378.00 15.00% $321.30 www.pcmallgov.com 

21" LCD Samsung Samsung 2253BW 22" Widescreen LCD Display 2253bw $288.99 12.00% $254.31 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD HYUNDAI 22" Monitor X224W $253.99 15.00% $215.89 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD AOC 22" Monitor 2216SW $223.99 15.00% $190.39 www.pcmallgov.com 
21" LCD ACER 22" Monitor ET.2216B.0D0 $222.99 4.00% $214.07 www.pcmallgov.com 

24" LCD HP
 HP-w2408h Vivid Color 24'' Widescreen Flat 
Panel Monitor GM712AA#ABA $474.99 15.00% $403.74 www.pcmallgov.com 

24" LCD HP
HP DreamColor LP2480zx 24" Professional LCD 
Display GV546A4#ABA $3,499.00 15.00% $2,974.15 www.pcmallgov.com 

24" LCD Planar PX2411W 24" Widescreen LCD Monitor 997-3374-00 $479.00 15.00% $407.15 www.pcmallgov.com 
24" LCD Viewsonic 24" Optiquest Widescreen LCD Display Q241WB $499.00 15.00% $424.15 www.pcmallgov.com 
24" LCD Samsung SyncMaster 24" LCD Monitor - Black 245BW $739.00 15.00% $628.15 www.pcmallgov.com 

C. Docking Station Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Ethernet- RJ45
Audio Line In/Out
Video- 15 Pin High Density
Keyboard USB
Mouse USB

Fujitsu Fujitsu USB Docking station FPCPR74 $129.00 20.00% $103.20 www.pcmallgov.com 
Toshiba dynadock USB Docking Station with DVI port PA3541U-2PRP $147.99 20.00% $118.39 www.pcmallgov.com 

HP
SmartBuy Docking Station with 120W Smart 
Adapter EN488UT#ABA $159.00 20.00% $127.20 www.pcmallgov.com 
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D. Port Replicator Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Audio Headpnone
Audio RCA Digital Coax
Ethernet- RJ45
Video- S-Video
Video- RCA Composite
Serial- 9 Pin D-Shell
Serial- RJ 11 Mod

Fujitsu Fujitsu Port Replicator FPCPR63AR $208.99 20.00% $167.19 www.pcmallgov.com 

Toshiba
Toshiba Express Port Replicator w/90W AC 
Adapter PA3508U-1PRP $199.99 20.00% $159.99 www.pcmallgov.com 

E. External USB Floppy Drive Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

1.44MB
Q-see Q-see Q-stor External USB Floppy Drive QFDTU14 $23.99 12.00% $21.11 www.pcmallgov.com 
LacIE LaCie Pocket Floppy Disk Drive 706018 $28.99 12.00% $25.51 www.pcmallgov.com 
sMARTdISK SmartDisk FDUSBTM2 Floppy Drive FDUSB-TM2 $34.99 12.00% $30.79 www.pcmallgov.com 

F. Network Interface Cards Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

10/100/1000 BASE-T (RJ 45)
Belkin BELKIN Gigabit Desktop Network PCI Card F5D5005 $28.99 10.00% $26.09 www.pcmallgov.com 
SMC SMC SMC9452TX-1 $18.99 10.00% $17.09 www.pcmallgov.com 

G. Mouse Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Optical Scroll Mouse- PS/2 Logitech Logitech Labtec Wheel Mouse 910-000210 $5.99 17.00% $4.97 www.pcmallgov.com 
Optical Scroll Mouse- PS/2 Logitech Logitech SBF-90 Value Optical Mouse 953817-2403 $7.99 17.00% $6.63 www.pcmallgov.com 
Optical Scroll Mouse- PS/2 Logitech Logitech SBF-96 Optical Wheel Mouse 953688-1403 $8.99 17.00% $7.46 www.pcmallgov.com 

Optical Scroll Mouse- USB Labtech
LABTECH 800 PS2 USB BLACK/ SILVER 
OPTICAL SCROLL MOUSE PC 931734-0403 $7.99 17.00% $6.63 www.pcmallgov.com 

Optical Scroll Mouse- USB Logitech Logitech SBF-96 Optical Wheel Mouse 931637-0403 $7.44 17.00% $6.17 www.pcmallgov.com 
Optical Scroll Mouse- USB Microsoft Microsoft Basic Optical Mouse P58-00001 $14.95 17.00% $12.40 www.pcmallgov.com 

H. Keyboard Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Standard Keyboard- PS/2 Keytronic Keytronic E05366P1 Keyboard E05366P1  $7.99 12.00% $7.03 www.pcmallgov.com 
Standard Keyboard- PS/2 HP HP PS/2 Standard Keyboard RV647AV#ABA $11.99 15.00% $10.19 www.pcmallgov.com 
Standard Keyboard- PS/2 Logitech Logitech Deluxe 250 Desktop 967973-0403 $12.63 15.00% $10.74 www.pcmallgov.com 
Standard Keyboard- USB Logitech Logitech Deluxe 250 USB Keyboard 967738‐0403 $7.99 15.00% $6.79 www.pcmallgov.com 
Standard Keyboard- USB Adesso Adesso AKB‐130PS Multimedia Keyboard  AKB‐130PS $13.99 15.00% $11.89 www.pcmallgov.com 
Standard Keyboard- USB Cherry Cherry J82‐16001 Business K‐1 Keyboard  J8216001LUNEU2   $9.99 15.00% $8.49 www.pcmallgov.com 
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I. Battery Back Up Unit Unit Price Discount %
Unit Discounted 

Price 
Link  To Publically 
Available Price List

Outout Capacity- 865Watts/ 1440VA
Nominal Output/Input Voltage- 120V
Output Connection Type- (6) NEMA 5-15R
Half Load Run Time- 20 minutes
Full Load Run Time- 7 minutes
Rackmount/Tower

APC SC1500 $358.25 7.00% $333.17 www.pcmallgov.com 

Warranty is manufacturer's warranty

Units above are base offerings.

*Please provide link to publicly available price list. 
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ATTACHMENT B
VA-090202-PCMG PRICING

Discounts are deducted from http://www.pcmallgov.com pricing

Memory
Mfg:

  Power User  No Bid No Bid
Kingston  22 22

 HP/Compaq  22 22
 Lexar Media  13 13

 Kingston - Value Ram  22 22
SanDisk Corporation 28 28

 IBM  23 23
Dell No Bid No Bid

Gateway No Bid No Bid
Simpletech 20 20

EDGE 22 22
SMART MODULAR 22 22

US MODULAR 7 7
Viking 6 6

Monitors
Mfg:

NEC/Mitsubishi 6 6
Planar 6 6
Phillips 7 7
Sony 6 6

ViewSonic 5 5
Acer 8 8

ProView 8 8
Enivision Peripherals(EPI) 8 8

CTX 6 6
Gateway No Bid No Bid

DELL
IBM 8 8
HP 13 13

EIZO 9 9
Monitors Con't

APPLE No Bid 10
BENQ 5 5

HITACHI 5 5
MEGAVISION 6 6
PRINCETON 6 6

3G TECHNOLOGY 5 5



SCEPTRE 5 5
XEROX 5 5

SAMSUNG 10 10
ELO TouchScreen 3 3

Projectors
Mfg:

Canon 10 10
Epson 8 8

InFocus 8 8
DELL No Bid No Bid

Mistubishi 10 10
Avermedia 7 7

Elmo 7 7
NEC 12 12

Proxima 7 7
Sony 18 18

Toshiba 7 7
ViewSonic 5 5

BENQ 8 8
Optoma 7 7

HP 11 11
Sharp PG-A20X 4 4

Power Protection
Mfg:

APC 18 18
Belkin 25 25

Tripp-Lite 10 10
Fellowes 18 18

Eaton 5 5
Liebert 8 8

ENERGIZER 8 8

Networking Accessories
Mfg:

3 Com 12 12
Linksys 10 10

IBM 10 10
Intel 14 14

Hawking Technology 30 30
NetGear 9 9
D-Link 5 5
Belkin 9 9

PowerDsine 5 5
APPLE No Bid No Bid



HP 15 15
Axis 5 5

Optical & Storage Devices
Mfg:

Iomega 8 8
Sony 14 14

Plextor 8 8
Samsung 7 7
Memorex 18 18

La Cie 10 10
HP/Compaq 15 15

DELL No Bid No Bid
IBM 12 12

Gateway No Bid No Bid
SEAGATE 10 10
MAXTOR 10 10

Wiebetech Foresic Field Unit 5 5

Input Devices
Mfg:

Logitech 12 12
Microsoft 10 10
Fellowes 18 18

Kensington 20 20
Labtec 27 27

Adaptec NA NA
Simple Technology NA NA

IBM 11 11
DELL No Bid No Bid

Gateway No Bid No Bid
HP 15 15

PDAs
Mfg:

Palm 12 12
HP/Compaq 8 8

Sony 10 10
Dell no bid no bid

Sharp 12 12
Toshiba 5 5

Handspring 8 8
ViewSonic 7 7



Scanners
Mfg:

Epson 10 10
Fujitsu 22 22

HP/Compaq 18 18
Kodak 25 25
Canon 14 14

Motorola 7 7
Honeywell 5 5

Wasp 5 5
Microtek 6 6
UMAX 10 10

Processor Upgrades
Mfg

Intel 10 10
AMD 9 9

Cables
Mfg:

APC 75 75
Tripp-Lite 59 59

3M 18 18
Star-Tech 55 55

Belkin 63 63
Iogear 46 46

HP/Compaq 28 28
Belden 15 15

BlackBox 32 32
CABLES 2 GO 20 20

Expansion Cards
Mfg:

ATI 10 10
3COM 8 8

NetGear 9 9
Creative Labs 10 10
Allied Telesyn 10 10
HP/Compaq 18 18

Linksys 10 10
Orinoco 9 9

Cameras
Mfg:

Kodak 5 5



Sharp 6 6
Panasanic 12 12

Sony 10 10
Canon 8 8
Nikon 8 8

Olympus 7 7
Minolta  7 7

JVC 8 8
HP/Compaq  11 11

Sharp 6 6
CASIO 12 12
FUJI 5 5

KYOCERA 18 18

Other
Mfg:

Targus 10 10
Fellowes 18 18

APC 18 18
Kensington 20 20

Belkins 10 10
Havis/Ledco 6 6

Gamber 6 6
3M 12 12

Cables to Go 21 21
IBM 8 8

HP/Compaq 8 8
DELL No Bid No Bid

Gateway No Bid No Bid
MAXTOR 10 10
SEAGATE 10 10

Oncore Power IBM ThinkPad T40 R50 Battery 5 5


